
Your Group Name and Princess Cruises Presents: 
8 Days  From $898.00pp Interior Cabin 

Canada & New England Cruise 
Roundtrip from New York City (Manhattan or Brooklyn), New York 

(Call for Dates and Rates) 
 

 

 

Date  Port      Arrive  Depart 

Sat, Oct 4  New York City (Manhattan or Brooklyn)    05:00 pm 

Sun, Oct 5 Newport, Rhode Island (Water Shuttle Required) 07:00 am 05:00 pm 

Mon, Oct 6 Boston, Massachusetts    11:00 am 08:00 pm 

Tue, Oct 7 Bar Harbor, Maine ( Water Shuttle Required ) 07:00 am 07:00 pm 

Wed, Oct 8  Saint John (for the Bay of Fundy), Canada 07:00 am 03:00 pm 

Thu, Oct 9 Halifax, Canada     08:00 am 06:00 pm 

Fri, Oct 10 At Sea (onboard experience)   

Sat, Oct 11 New York City (Manhattan or Brooklyn)  06:00 am  



*Please note that prices are listed per person, non-air cruise-only and based on double occupancy. Third and 

Fourth guest fares apply to the 3rd and 4th guests booked in the same stateroom as the First and Second guests. 

Launch Fares are offering fares and may not have been in effect for the past 90 days or resulted in actual sales 

in all categories. Intermediate discounts may have been taken and fares may remain at discounted levels after 

this promotion. Taxes, Fees & Port Expenses are subject to change and Princess reserves the right to collect 

any increases in effect at the time of sailing even if the fare has already been paid in full. Prices are subject to 

change based on availability. Stateroom views are considered unobstructed unless noted otherwise. Photos, 

floor plan diagrams, and amenities represent typical arrangements and may vary by ship and stateroom. Certain 

staterooms may vary in size, decor and configuration. Obstructions do not include certain nautical items like 

handrails, dividers or ship hardware. For balcony staterooms, the view is determined from the perspective of 

the balcony railing. Prices shown in USD. Please review Passage Contract for Cancellation Policy. 

NEW YORK CITY 

 

A leading global city, New York exerts a powerful influence over worldwide commerce, finance, 
culture and fashion, and entertainment. The city consists of five boroughs and an intricate 
patchwork of neighborhoods. Some of these include Lower Manhattan and the New York Stock 
Exchange, Battery Park and South Street Seaport, Chinatown, trendy SoHo and Greenwich 
Village, along with Little Italy, the flat Iron District and Gramercy Park. Famous Central Park 
covers 843 acres of paths, ponds, lakes and green space within the asphalt jungle. Many districts 
and landmarks have become well-known to outsiders. Nearly 170 languages are spoken in the city 
and over 35% of its population was born outside the United States. 

NEWPORT, RHODE ISLAND 



 
In the 19th century, Newport was America's Versailles. It was here that the great merchant princes 
and robber barons of the Gilded Age erected the elaborate summerhouses they so ingenuously 
dubbed "cottages." At the height of its splendor, a Newport season was a giddy whirl of grand 
fêtes, yacht races and elaborate beach picnics for assorted Vanderbilts, Astors and Morgans. 
Today, it is the privileged traveler who marvels at the splendor of great mansions like The 
Breakers, The Elms, or Rosecliff. Gone are the days when "Tessie" Oelrichs, one of Newport's 
fabled hostesses, had 12 skeleton ships anchored offshore and dramatically lit for her legendary 
"White Ball." 
 
Please Note: Newport is an anchorage port. Transfer from the ship to shore will be via the ship's 
tender service. 
In ports where guests utilize tender boats to go ashore, Princess staff will make every effort to 
assist but are not allowed to individually physically lift more than 50 lbs. (22kg). Guests requiring 
physical assistance must travel with an able-bodied companion. With your safety and comfort in 
mind, the final decision to permit or prohibit passengers from going ashore will be made on each 
occasion by the ship's Captain. 

BOSTON, MASSACHUSETTES 

 



 
 
Hailed as the "Cradle of American Independence," Boston is filled with historic sites. Boston was 
America's first great city. In the 19th century, Boston was rightly described as the "Athens of 
America." Today this city of 800,000 retains its vitality, combining historic districts with revitalized 
urban centers while remaining faithful to its venerable roots. It is a city every American should visit 
at least once. Follow the Freedom Trail along three of the most historic miles in the country. See 
the site of the Boston Tea Party, trace the route of Paul Revere's famous ride, and stand on the 
bridge where Minutemen fired "the shot heard 'round the world." In the old Charlestown Navy Yard 
you can see the USS Constitution, the nation's oldest commissioned warship. (Note: The USS 
Constitution will be in dry dock from March 2015 – March 2018 for planned restoration.) 

 
 
 
BAR HARBOR, MAINE 
 



 
 
Standing atop Cadillac Mountain in Acadia National Park, it is easy to see why individuals like 
John D. Rockefeller felt so strongly about preserving this area's natural beauty. 
 
Established by individual donations, Acadia National Park is a stunning intersection of sea-
scoured shores, towering cliffs, and forested mountains. Mount Desert Island had been a resort 
destination well before the establishment of Acadia National Park in 1919. The wealthy flocked to 
Bar Harbor at the turn of the century, building Newport-style "cottages" that turned the quaint New 
England town into a fashionable summer resort. It was the efforts of these wealthy vacationers, 
including John D. Rockefeller, which led President Woodrow Wilson to establish Acadia as the first 
national park east of the Mississippi. Many of Bar Harbor's great houses are a memory. A 
catastrophic fire in 1947 ravaged the town and the surrounding forest. But Acadia National Park 
survived, and today it is one of the most visited national parks in America. Acadia's 35,000 acres 
are studded with natural wonders: In addition to the stunning landscape, some 50 species of 
mammals including moose, black bear and white tail deer roam the park. 

Saint John, New Brunswick (For the Bay of Fundy) 

 

 



Saint John, Canada's oldest settlement is the gateway to the scenic wonders of New Brunswick. 
One of Canada's oldest provinces, New Brunswick remains remarkably unspoiled: 85 percent of 
the province remains unsettled. New Brunswick boasts vast forests, purling streams, gentle hills, 
rich farmlands, and a spectacular coastline dotted by historic towns. Nature also blessed the area 
with one of her most astonishing phenomena: the reversing River Rapids. The fierce tides of the 
Bay of Fundy rise with such force that they actually cause the St. John River to reverse direction 
and its waters to flow upstream. Saint John's history dates to 1604, when the Sieur de Champlain 
landed nearby on the feast day of Saint John the Baptist. After the American Revolution, American 
Loyalists flocked to the area. Saint John became a thriving industrial port. But the catastrophic fire 
of 1877, declining commerce and decades of neglect gave the town a sad and careworn look for 
decades. That changed in recent years. Redevelopment of the waterfront and the old district has 
restored Saint John's charm and its sense of history 

HALIFAX, NOVA SCOTIA 

 
 
The capital of Nova Scotia and the largest city in Canada's Atlantic Provinces, Halifax was once 
Great Britain's major military bastion in North America. The beautifully restored waterfront 
buildings of Halifax's Historic Properties recall the city's centuries-old maritime heritage. Stroll the 
waterfront, and you may find Nova Scotia's floating ambassador, the schooner Bluenose II, tied up 
to Privateer's Wharf, just as old sailing ships have done for over 200 years. Halifax is also the 
gateway to Nova Scotia's stunning scenery, including famous Peggy's Cove, where surf-pounded 
granite cliffs and a solitary lighthouse create an unsurpassed scene of rugged natural beauty 

 



 

 
 

 

Emerald Princess® 

Your adventure begins the moment you step aboard. With nearly 900 staterooms with balconies, 

you'll awaken each day to a new horizon. Experience the relaxed ambience onboard and 

tantalizing cuisine in our elegant dining rooms. Enrich yourself with Discovery at SEA™ 

programs and unwind at the The Sanctuary, a tranquil haven reserved for adults. 

• Last Refurbished: April 2019 

• Guest Capacity: 3,080 lower berths 

• Number of Crew: 1,200 

• Tonnage: 113,561 

Learn more about Emerald Princess® 

Princess MedallionClass® Vacations 



 

Personalized. Effortless. 
It starts with a quarter-sized, wearable device that unlocks an effortless, personalized vacation. 

Have food, drinks and more delivered wherever you are. Reserve dining and activities. Enjoy 

fast, reliable Wi-Fi as well as touchless embarkation and payment. Do your vacation your way 

on a Princess MedallionClass® cruise. 

More Onboard 



 

Dining 

Passionate about our culinary craft, we’re committed to serving you mouthwatering, handcrafted 

dishes made from scratch throughout your voyage. Be sure to join us at one of our award-

winning specialty restaurants to celebrate your next birthday, anniversary or milestone and enjoy 

tantalizing specialties. 

• Sabatini’s Trattoria^ 

• The Salty Dog Gastropub^ 

• Chocolate Journeys℠ 

• Crown Grill℠ (steakhouse)^ 

• Crab Shack^ 

• Chef's Table Experience^ 

• Vines (wine bar)^ 



• International Café 

• Horizon Court (buffet) 

• Trident Grill (burgers & hot dogs) 

 

^Specialty restaurant - nominal charges may apply.   

 

Activities 

Each day, a world of exciting activities awaits, from cooking demonstrations to dance classes, 

trivia contests and a range of enrichment programs, including our Encounters with Discovery at 

SEA™ speaker series from experts who offer insights into the places you’ll visit. 

• Discovery at SEA™ Programs 

• Festivals of the World 

• The Piazza 



• Shops of Princess 

• Art Gallery & Auctions 

• Photo & Video Gallery 

• Freshwater Pools & Hot Tubs 

• Sports Court (basketball, volleyball, tennis) 

• Princess Links (putting course) 

 

Entertainment 

There’s always something happening on board — from heading to the Princess Theater for a 

lavish original musical production to enjoying a blockbuster movie poolside under the stars or 

simply relaxing in a lounge sipping a cocktail where a live band is playing your song. 

• Movies Under the Stars® 



• The Voice of the Ocean (live show) 

• Original Musical Productions 

• Music & Dancing 

• Vegas-style Casino 

• Featured Guest Entertainers 

• Princess Theater 

• Club Fusion (dance club) 

• Skywalkers Nightclub 

• Crooners Bar 

 

Joyful Rejuvenation 

Everything you need to refresh body and mind is right on board. Indulge in a manicure, pedicure 

or a makeover in the salon, or a soothing massage in the Lotus Spa®. Or maybe it’s a brisk 



workout in the fitness center, followed by a little “me time” in The Sanctuary, a tranquil retreat 

reserved just for adults. 

• The Princess Luxury Bed 

• SLEEP by Princess 

• The Sanctuary (retreat for adults)^ 

• Lotus Spa®^ 

• Lotus Spa® Fitness Center 

• Fitness Classes^ 

 

^Nominal charges may apply.   

 

Families 



Voted “Best Cruise Line for multi-generational family travel” by Porthole Cruise Magazine 2018 

Readers' Choice Awards, Princess fosters family reconnection over meaningful moments of 

discovery, relaxation and happiness, from grandparents to grandkids and everyone in between. 

• Camp Discovery Youth Centers & Teen Lounges 

• Discovery at SEA experiences like Stargazing and Indoor Planetarium^ 

• Discovery™ and Animal Planet™ Shore Excursions 

• Live Animal Experiences in the Piazza^ 

• Stanley the Bear and much more 

• Festivals of the World 

• Movies Under the Stars® 

• Unique Holiday Activities^ 

 
^On select sailings. 

 

Youth & Teen Programs 

In partnership with Discovery™, Princess® has developed wonder-filled Camp Discovery centers 
and engaging experiences for cruisers ages 3 to 17. Named “Best Cruise Line for Families” by 



Travel & Leisure, our diverse programs offer every child and teen what they need to spark 
curiosity, fuel creativity and inspire an active life. 

• The Treehouse, ages 3 to 7 

• The Lodge, ages 8 to 12 

• The Beach House, ages 13 to 17 

 
Club 6 

 

Call for additional dates and rates!!!!  888-293-3330 


